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Abstract: In this paper, I shall attempt to respond to the charge that the digital labour theory, 
as developed by Christian Fuchs, doesn’t faithfully stick to the Marxist schema of the Labour 
Theory of Value by arguing that Marx’s critique of capitalism was based on the social and 
material cost of exploitation and the impact of capitalist exploitation of the working class. En-
gels’s analysis of The Condition of The Working Class in England links the various forms of 
violence faced by the working class to the bourgeois rule that props their exploitation. I shall 
argue, within the framework of Critical Social Media Studies, that the rapid advance of fascist 
and authoritarian regimes represents a similar development of violence and dispossession, 
with digital capitalism being a major factor catalysing the rifts within societies. It shall be fur-
ther argued that much like the exploitative nature of labour degrades social linkages and cre-
ates conditions of that exaggerates social contradictions, the “labour” performed by social 
media users degenerates social relations and promotes a hyper-violent spectacle that aids 
and abets fascist and authoritarian regimes. 
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1. Introduction 

This paper will attempt at a convergence of multiple trajectories of critical research in 
social media studies. Starting with an analysis of the concept of digital labour it will 
be argued that rethinking contemporary debates is required in the light of the devel-
opments in AI and machine learning over the past decades. We will then attempt to 
understand Engels’s conception of alienation from a Marxist-Humanist perspective, 
and attempt to locate the alienation of digital labour within this framework. Next, we 
will look at recommender systems and the role of alienated digital labour in the de-
velopment of its algorithms, and the development of filter bubbles that lead to echo 
chambers of right-wing opinion. Finally, our analysis of these echo-chambers and the 
role of social media brings us to the society of the spectacle as defined by Guy 
Debord, where social relations are distorted by the violence of the spectacle. 

2. A Critical Rethinking of Digital Labour 

The emergence of Critical Social Media Studies and the concept of digital labour 
have attracted its fair share of critiques. The main issue that these critiques share is 
the rather unorthodox categorisation of labour and subsequently its view of exploita-
tion. In order to develop an understanding of the concept of digital labour, we must 
look at the definition of labour itself, especially in its relation to the overall Marxist 
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framework within which the concept has been formulated. It is also important to look 
at the types of labour actually being engaged by users rather than simply pigeonhol-
ing them into pre-existing categories of labour. 

The commodity has two distinct aspects, use-value and exchange-value, which 
are of a contradictory nature (Marx 1867; Marx 1865). The use-value of a commodity 
refers to the utility of the commodity, and can only be realised in either use or con-
sumption (Marx 1867, 126). The exchange-value of a commodity, on the other hand, 
refers to the quantitative relation in which use-values of one kind can exchange for 
use-values of another. In a class society, exchange-value is itself created through the 
use of labour-power, which must then be reproduced. Marx (1867, 320) divides this 
labour-power into necessary labour, i.e. labour that creates all the necessary values 
for the reproduction of labour-power, and surplus-labour, i.e. labour that creates sur-
plus-value over and above what is necessary for the reproduction of labour-power. 
This divides work-time into the categories of necessary labour-time and surplus la-
bour-time with surplus valu’ being created from the latter. Capitalists seek to maxim-
ise the production of surplus value, either by increasing the total work-time (which 
can be done by mainly extending the length of the workday) or decreasing the dura-
tion of the necessary labour-time, which is then taken up by surplus labour-time 
(which can mainly be done by introducing more productive technology). 

The theoretical underpinnings of digital labour lie in rethinking the concepts of 
value and abstract labour as simultaneous expressions of political economy and so-
cio-political class struggle (Fuchs 2014). Fuchs and Sevignani (2013) outline the the 
Hegel-Marxist triangle model of work, which is then employed to develop the concept 
of digital work, which defines communication itself as a form of work. This approach 
however negates the concept of immaterial labour involved in the production of the 
cultural content of a commodity (Hardt and Negri 2004; Lazzarato 1996). Fuchs 
(2014, 252) has argued that information work is material itself, and is intrinsically 
linked to the materiality of work and thus doesn’t require a distinct categorical marker. 
Dallas Smythe (1977b) argues that the development of what he calls the conscious-
ness industry represents an encroachment of the leisure time of workers through the 
use of advertisements. He develops the concept of the audience commodity, where 
the labour-power of workers is sold as a commodity through the medium of adver-
tisements (Smythe 1977a; 1977b). The conditions under which this sale of labour-
power takes place are distinct from the commonly known form of the exchange of 
value, as the working audience is both the subject and the object of this transaction. 
The audience performs the labour of learning about the particular brand, and is thus 
responsible for the creation of demand for that particular commodity within the do-
main of monopoly capitalism (Smythe 1977b). Thus, the process of reproduction of 
labour-power in itself is congealed into the audience labour performed by the work-
ers/audience. In order to understand digital labour, the concept of the audience 
commodity is modified into the concept of the Internet prosumer commodity (Fuchs 
2014, 93-94). Digital labour follows the trajectory set by the concept of audience la-
bour, with users being both producers of content as well as its main consumers, 
while at the same time generating a surplus-value of Internet prosumer commodities, 
which can then be sold to advertisers (Fuchs 2013). 

In the book Culture and Economy in the Age of Social Media, Fuchs (2015) out-
lines the major debates surrounding digital labour, so for our purposes we will briefly 
take a look at the critiques of the application of Marx’s theory of value to digital la-
bour. James Reveley (2013) has argued for the abandonment of the concept of digi-
tal labour in favour of a Marxist pursuit of social media’s influence on labour-power. 



54     Aishik Saha 

   CC-BY-NC-ND: Creative Commons License, 2021. 

The argument he makes is that the overall framework of the Labour Theory of Value 
that Marx has espoused is not strictly adhered to, especially the relation between 
necessary labour and surplus labour. He also negates Smythe’s concept of the audi-
ence commodity on the basis of the same objection. The same rejection of the Marx-
ist theorisation of value forms the basis of the criticism by Arvidsson and Colleoni 
(2012). Rather than the sale of a prosumer commodity, “any discussion of value 
needs to take into account the central role finance plays in the appropriation and dis-
tribution of value” (Arvidsson and Colleoni 2012, 136). Kaan Kangal’s critique argues 
that user information is already a commodity before it enters the Internet and thus 
users cannot be said to produce value, and argues that Fuchs’ “exploitation thesis 
dislocates the source of profit made by media companies from selling the advertise-
ment rights to the value production of Internet users” (Kangal 2016, 7). Bolaño and 
Vieira (2015) on argue that the concept of the audience commodity remains a valid 
analytical tool, but say that the idea of users performing labour needs to be criticised. 
They argue: “What is sold by Google, by the way, is not the users themselves […] 
because the advertiser does not buy any individual users or even their singular in-
formation. Advertisers buy only an amount of data about a target audience based on 
categories, as we have outlined” (Bolaño and Vieira 2015). A similar approach is 
shared by Robinson, who argues that advertising on the Web 2.0 actually helps “real-
ize value produced elsewhere” rather than being the source of surplus-value itself 
(Robinson 2014, 50). 

The confusion regarding the role and labour of Internet users is primarily due to 
the diversity of the types of activity and the ways in which Web 2.0 functions. Chris-
toph Raetzsch (2016) raises this issue by pointing out to the diverse ways in which 
different websites like Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, as well as search engines like 
Google or online encyclopaedias like Wikipedia work. The inability to perform a dif-
ferential diagnosis of the rate of profit is the main reason that many of the critics of 
the theory of digital labour refuse to analyse it within a Marxist framework (Reveley 
2013; Arvidsson and Colleoni 2012). In treating data as a pre-existing use-value, as 
emphasised by the metaphors of oil and coal, the interaction between users and so-
cial media platforms as experience is overlooked (World Economic Forum 2012; 
Raetzsch 2016). However, Interactive Machine Learning (IML) has introduced us to a 
different conceptualisation of digital labour. Defined as “the science of getting com-
puters to realize a task without being explicitly programmed”, Machine Learning has 
essentially automated the task of developing algorithms for mining through data 
(Rocca 2019). Not only do the users provide data, they are, in this model, actually 
performing the labour of training algorithms. This point is stressed by Amershi et al. 
(2014, 106) who point out that in contrast to conventional machine learning, “model 
updates in IML are more rapid (the model gets updated immediately in response to 
user input), focused (only a particular aspect of the model is updated), and incremen-
tal (the magnitude of the update is small; the model does not change drastically with 
a single update). This allows users to interactively examine the impact of their actions 
and adapt subsequent inputs to obtain desired behaviors. As a result of these rapid 
interaction cycles, even users with little or no machine-learning expertise can steer 
machine-learning behaviors through low-cost trial and error or focused experimenta-
tion with inputs and outputs”. The participation of networked communities like those 
of social media can boost the incremental nature of updates to a more dynamic one. 
Within the IML model, the users definitely do perform labour, which leads to updates 
of algorithms and an overall advancement of the recommender systems. The ad-
vances in machine learning through user inputs means that users are also participat-
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ing in the process of alienation. Dead labour is in this manner being used to appro-
priate labour-power, which represents the classic Marxist confrontation between la-
bour and capital. Understanding this alienation is thus crucial to understanding the 
way in which digital labour is transforming contemporary capitalism. 

3. Engels and Marxist Humanism 

Our conception of exploitation cannot however be satisfied with a mechanistic under-
standing of exploitation, but rather has to look at the effects of exploitation and alien-
ation on the working class itself. Engels’s analysis in The Condition of the Working 
Class in England (1845b) provides an understanding of the capitalist exploitation of 
the industrial working class in 19th century England. Engels laid the ground for the 
critique of the political economy of capitalism. In this section, we shall interrogate the 
role of digital labour and its forms of alienation, and its impact on the socio-historical 
process, especially by analysing the Marxist Humanism of Friedrich Engels. 

The question of alienation features prominently here and we must deal with it 
briefly before proceeding. Gajo Petrović (1963, 421) summarises Marx’s views: 

Marx begins with the alienation of the results of man’s labor, alienation of ob-
jects produced by man. The realization of labor is its objectification, and this 
objectification is for the laborer at the same time the loss of object, alienation. 
To the product of his labor the worker is related as to an alien object. Products 
of his hands constitute a separate world of objects which is alien to him, which 
dominates him, and which enslaves him. 

Dead labour, which is capital, can only survive by extracting living labour, and thus 
the relationship between capital and labour is perennially antagonistic. Marx (1844) 
points out in the Economic and Philosophic Manuscripts of 1844 that there are four 
stages of alienation that occur within a class society: 
 

 The alienation of a person’s own labour, and subsequently the alienation of the 
products of their labour. 

 The alienation of the process of production, which ensures that productive activity 
results in the subjugation of the worker rather than their freedom. 

 The alienation of the worker, who is a creative being, from their creative ability. By 
depriving a worker of their creative ability, Marx opines that the process alienates 
the worker from their humanity itself. 

 The alienation of humans from their own species being. The relationship between 
humans is distorted by the prism of class society, i.e. the contemporary capitalist 
society. 

 
The final point leads us to an understanding of commodity fetishism where relation-
ships between commodities become a determinant for social relationships between 
humans. The alienated labour therefore goes on to dominate the worker, who has 
performed the labour to produce it. Finally the increasing accumulation of capital en-
ables the displacement of the worker into the ranks of the unemployed reserve army 
of labour. Thus, the greater amount of labour workers perform, the more they con-
tribute to their own alienation and oppression. 

Engels has, over the past century, been dogged by the tag of being a vulgar ma-
terialist, in one form or the other, and has been posed against Marx’s more Hegelian 
tendencies. Before we proceed to establish Engels’s humanist credentials, we must 
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seek to understand what Marxism’s contribution to humanist philosophy has been 
and to what extent Marxism itself is a humanist philosophy. Donald Clark Hodges 
(1965, 191) has argued that one of Marx’s critical contribution to humanism was “its 
addition of a material, bodily, passionate and sensuous content to traditional human-
ism and the elevation of this content to the status of liberal activity” and “its develop-
ment of the social and humanitarian elements of traditional humanism”. Raya Duna-
yevskaya (1965, 63) has in fact argued that not only is the view that Marx abandoned 
his early humanist philosophy false, but conversely humanism “gives Marx’s magnum 
opus its force and direction”. She points out that Marx’s critique of commodity fetish-
ism and alienation is integral to Marxism rather than simply a stepping stone to the 
critique of capital. A similar line of argument is forwarded by John Roche (2005) in 
his critique of Louis Althusser, demonstrating that Marx’s critique of human alienation 
and human liberation draws upon Feuerbach’s critique of religious alienation. He also 
opines that Marx champions the proletariat as he views struggling workers as agents 
of human liberation. In its unification of the world of sensuous and spiritual experi-
ences Marxism seeks human liberation in the liberation from the material conditions 
that make such exploitation possible. 

If the proletariat is viewed as the agent of human liberation, it is Engels who must 
be credited with recognising its crucial role, which then became a definitive aspect of 
both his and Marx’s works. Ann Dennehy (1996) writes that the earliest works of En-
gels lacks a proper theoretical framework through which he could analyse his per-
spectives on the impoverishments that he saw. This synergy between Marx’s and 
Engels’s own inputs helps in placing the “blank face and figure of Marx’s abstract 
proletarian” into “a real house and real factory” (Wilson 1940, 146). Engels (1845b) 
establishes through his Dickensian description of the living and working condition of 
the working class the true nature of exploitation. In his studies of the early communist 
colonies the contrast with the wretched conditions of the industrial working class is 
rather clearly presented (Engels 1845b). Engels’s condemnation of the capitalist sys-
tem is quite clear: 

When one individual inflicts bodily injury upon another such injury that death 
results, we call the deed manslaughter; when the assailant knew in advance 
that the injury would be fatal, we call his deed murder. But when society plac-
es hundreds of proletarians in such a position that they inevitably meet a too 
early and an unnatural death, one which is quite as much a death by violence 
as that by the sword or bullet […] (Engels 1845b, 393-394) 

Engels’s recognition of this social murder caused by hunger, starvation and disease, 
or even the precarious conditions of living that make one prone to various fatal acci-
dents is clearly aimed at the hypocrisy of bourgeois humanism and thus seeking to 
extend the boundaries of humanist thought to include the industrial proletariat. These 
social murders are not limited to industrial towns or capitalist countries but also ex-
tend into the domains of the colonies. The multiplicity of plagues and famines in the 
colonies can only be explained as products of capitalist alienation. The role of aliena-
tion figures heavily as the main instrument in ensuring inequality, which in turn acts 
as a motivator for workers to continue participating in the system. Richard Peet 
(1975) points out that this hierarchical inequality needs to be recreated, which is 
largely achieved through a geographical uneven distribution of resources. Engels too 
notes that the graded inequality marks the difference between the English and Irish 
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workers in England, with English workers being more disposed towards skilled work, 
while the Irish workers were filling the ranks of workers with less technical expertise. 

Kun Wu and Qiong Nan (2020) point to the expansion of the scope of dialectics 
by Engels, including the critique of idealist dialectics, which led to the emergence of 
materialist dialectics. In Dialectics of Nature (1883), as E. San Juan Jr. (1995) ar-
gues, Engels (1883) sees motion as an inherent attribute of matter that can help us 
to comprehend all processes occurring in the universe including thought. This is 
viewed as an erasure of subjectivity in Engels’s works, which denies any possibility of 
revolutionary action (Lukács 1971). However San Juan Jr. (1995, 412) identifies the 
revolutionary potential of Engels’s ideas of aesthetics, which like “religion […] is one 
of the fruits of the alienating division of labor”. Thus, while religion is understood to be 
a result of the alienation of humans from their species being, aesthetics can be seen 
as a reflection of the alienated creative being. In Description of Recently Founded 
Communist Colonies, Engels (1845a) argues that once all tasks are within the com-
munity, i.e. no longer being performed for capitalist profit but rather the overall use of 
all community members, their menial nature itself becomes meaningless. 

Digital labour confronts the prosumer by extremist online communities that are 
able to mobilise and inflict violence, which I propose should be included within the 
phenomenon of social murder. Engels’s recognition of human creativity’s revolution-
ary potential and the sources of its alienation, as well as the reproduction of this al-
ienation, helps us place it within the framework of the humanist conception of libera-
tion. The categorisation of social murder as a distinct feature of capitalist domination 
and a necessary aspect of the capitalist alienation of labour marks a major contribu-
tion to the understanding of alienation itself. 

4. The Alienation and Cyber-Balkanisation of Social Media 

It should by now be clear that digital capitalism has created its own forms of aliena-
tion, which in turn supports the development of hyper-nationalist/fascist ideologies in 
their wake. I shall borrow Van Alstyne and Brynjolfsson’s (2005) concept of Cyber-
Balkans in order to understand the growth of fascism in the digital era. It is necessary 
to explore the legitimisation of fringe discourses through social media, and the devel-
opment of a distorted consciousness and the forces which help the process. This will 
help us understand why the internet, instead of creating a space for free exchange of 
views and knowledge has rather helped as the expansion of forces of bigotry. 

Understanding the role played by recommender systems (RS) and the business 
models of social media sites is crucial to explaining the social divergence that lies at 
the root of the alienation caused by digital capitalism. In general RSs suggests 
content, denoted as items, to users based on a host of factors (Ricci, Rokach and 
Shapira 2011). The main task of a RS is identifying the interests of a user, whom we 
have identified in the paper as a prosumer, and then providing meaningful 
recommendations. With the rise of social media, many have sought to utilise these 
social linkages in developing and evaluating newer recommendation models, one 
such being the trust-enhanced recommendation techniques (Victor, De Cock and 
Cornelis 2011). Social networking sites like Facebook have provided a vast pool of 
data for recommender systems (Shapira, Rokach and Freilikhman 2013). In fact, the 
value of a recommendation is often determined by the strength of the interpersonal 
ties between the users (Oechslein and Hess 2014). Inputs from the user regarding 
their tasks through their likes, shares, and public engagement helps the 
recommender algorithm identify the user’s interests. The platform profits from being 
able to target users with highly specific advertisements and thus relies on the 
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accuracy of its recommendations (Curran, Graham and Temple 2011). The utilisation 
of social advertising through boosted collaborative filtering demonstrates that 
Facebook is incentivised to combine different filtering models in order to precisely 
target audiences (Fan and Chang 2010). 

Multiple studies have shown that online communities tend to coalesce into homo-
geneous groups with similar views. Eli Pariser (2011) emphasises that the Internet, 
based on the user’s previous searches and interests, can present very different pic-
tures of the world, which he argues results in a filter bubble that makes it increasingly 
difficult for users to encounter dissenting opinions. Jacobson, Myung and Johnson 
(2015, 13) have pointed out that on the Facebook wall of partisan news sites “audi-
ences have a limited number of sources they prefer to reference when discussing the 
news”. The growth of polarised communities or echo-chambers is also highlighted by 
Del Vicario et al. (2016), demonstrating that the effect of polarisation increases in 
both scientific and conspiracy theory-based communities. The more a user engages 
with the community, the more polarised their opinion tends to be. In the case of Twit-
ter, it has been demonstrated that users prefer to engage with other users of similar 
political views and share from sources that affirm their positions (Himelboim, McCre-
ery and Smith 2013). Studies of the debates surrounding Brexit as well as vaccina-
tion debates have demonstrated how the polarisation process takes place on social 
media (Schmidt et al. 2018; Vicarioa et al. 2017). A contrary view is presented by 
Möller et al. (2018) and Haim, Graefe and Brosius (2018). They point out that per-
sonalised and non-personalised news usually tend to have the same diversity. How-
ever they do not seem to consider that recommendations don’t only come from the 
recommender systems but also other users who are a part of the network of the user. 
The bias is thus structured into the recommender system’s logic rather than one that 
creeps in through usage. This phenomenon of cyber-balkanisation was predicted by 
Van Alstyne and Brynjolfsson (2005), though they seem to have underestimated the 
role that increasing pressures of commercialisation on social media sites and social 
recommender systems may have played. One may argue that social media sites are 
incentivised to expose users to a limited set of content mainly based on a user’s in-
teraction with other users and their own preferences, since it is useful for advertisers 
to target audiences most receptive to their messages. Recommenders are thus cali-
brated to increasingly serve this function. 

This phenomenon of cyber-balkanisation has been exemplified by the main-
streaming of extremist politics of the right over the past decade. Tania Bucher (2012) 
points out that APIs can articulate politics, which O’Callagan et al. (2015) point out 
how YouTube’s recommender algorithms can articulate right wing extremist politics. 
The model of platform capitalism, argues Tanner Mirrlees (2019), is what has allowed 
the alt-right to gain the kind of currency, which would otherwise have been outside of 
its reach leading to the platformisation of fascism. By repeatedly exposing users to a 
limited but trusted source of content, far-right politics is converted into an idea being 
performed on a platform, which legitimises its existence in the marketplace of ideas. 
While television, radio and other mass media have allowed politics to be performed, 
social media has allowed for performances to be politicised. 

Siva Vaidhyanathan (2018) highlights that social media, while purportedly sup-
porting the spread of democracy and freedom of speech across the world, has ironi-
cally given a major platform to political and social forces that subvert such objectives. 
Specifically focusing on Facebook, Vaidhyanathan (2018, 8) points out: 

 



tripleC 19 (1): 52-67, 2021 59 

CC-BY-NC-ND: Creative Commons License, 2021. 

Through its destructive influence on other media firms, industries, and institu-
tions, Facebook undermines their ability to support healthy public deliberation 
as well. Facebook distorts the very sources of news and information on which a 
democratic republic relies. 

 
Not only does Facebook change the way we see and share news, its business model 
has ensured that most advertising campaigns have shifted their focus to a social me-
dia centric model, which in turn has weaned away advertisement revenue from media 
houses. Trevor Garrison Smith (2017) on the other hand argues that the failure of 
political theorists to theorise politics in the digital age has resulted in a rejection of 
politics from both the left and the right. Fuchs (2018, 262) focuses on the neoliberal 
framework that has given rise to the authoritarian capitalism, pointing out that neolib-
eralism “is a huge machine of calculation and accumulation that tries to turn every-
thing into a commodity”. Since everything has been commoditised, it goes without 
saying that politics itself has been commoditised, lending itself to a far greater extent 
to the principles of advertisement and marketing than simple political rhetoric. Face-
book and other social networking sites primarily rely on algorithmic surveillance of 
user metadata in order to provide targeted advertisements (Doyle 2014). Much like 
commercial establishments, algorithmic surveillance allows political groups to target 
specific demographics based on recommender algorithms. The distortion thus takes 
place at two ends, with politics being framed increasingly to cater to digital de-
mographics, and recipients of such politics also imagining themselves as parts of cer-
tain in-groups based on choice or identity rather than a class. 

The alienation of digital labour, as with other forms of alienation, results in the al-
ienation of the prosumer from their species-being, as we saw previously. The com-
modification of human creativity through social media lies at the root of this aliena-
tion. Digital labour alienated from the prosumer confronts them as an alien force by 
distorting the politics and society within the conditions of neoliberal capitalism. The 
role played by recommender systems and the creation of the filter bubble are crucial 
aspects of this distortion that represent a major role in the alienation of humans from 
their own species being, i.e. social alienation. Under these circumstances the 
prosumer is converted into a market demographic, with the intersection or contradic-
tion between the two users determining their mutual interactions. 

4. Spectacular Alienation  

The notions of the spectacle and violence emerge as the key features of digital capi-
talism so far, and their inter-linkages must be explored to understand the process of 
alienation of digital labour. Guy Debord (1992) argues that the spectacle is created 
when the dominant mode of production invades the fabric of our social lives, where 
being itself becomes synonymous with having. Brad Evans and Henry A. Giroux 
(2015) point out that the spectacle of violence substitutes human empowerment. 
While we saw how alienated digital labour created the conditions for a spectacle in 
conditions of digital capitalism, how the spectacle creates conditions for the aliena-
tion of the prosumer class in particular and the overall working class in general re-
mains obscured. 

Debord (1992, 10) points out the fundamentally spectaclist nature of our modern 
society, underlining the power of the spectacle to subject human beings to itself is 
precisely due to the fact they have already been subjugated by the dominant mode of 
production, i.e. neoliberal capitalism. He further elaborates that given the alienating 
nature of the mode of production, life is identified with non-working time, i.e. leisure 
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time. Here Marx’s (1844) assessment of estranged labour confronting the worker as 
an alien force proves to be useful. Estranged labour is converted into the spectacle 
and performs two crucial tasks for the capitalist mode of production. On one hand, by 
imposing itself upon the leisure-time of the worker, it hinders the creative-ability of the 
worker (creative-being) by presenting celebrity-hood as the goal of social labour, 
while on the other hand, it falsifies social life on the basis of identities created out of 
trivialities, thus alienating the workers from their species-being. 

The term infotainment though somewhat appropriate doesn’t seem to grasp the 
cocktail of fear and hate that is channelised through social media, and is perhaps 
better exemplified as disinfotainment. Douglas Kellner (2003) points out to the multi-
ple instances of the spectacle propagated through mass media like the OJ Simpson 
trial, conspiracy theories regarding alien invasions or bio-weapons, with even the 
presidential elections being converted into spectacles. The fact that the interplay be-
tween media and activism does play a crucial role in negotiating the visibility of dis-
sent in the public space was noted by Bruce D’Arcus (2006), who described it as 
spectacles of dissent. Mohamed Nanabhay and Roxane Farmanfarmaian (2011, 
574) point out that in the case of Egypt in the initial stages of the uprising against 
Hosni Mubarak, “citizens [were not only] able to produce their own footage but to dis-
tribute it through social networks, thus bypassing mainstream media as the traditional 
gatekeeper of news”. In fact the role of social media throughout the Arab Spring has 
been widely remarked upon, as has its role in the Occupy Wall Street and other pro-
tests inspired by it. Paul Mihailidis and Samantha Viotty (2017) explored the partici-
pation of netizens in the spectacular US presidential elections of 2016, which 
demonstrated the fragmentation of social media discourse into closed-off echo-
chambers and allowed for the proliferation of post-truth discourse. Hannah Arendt 
(1994) points out that rather than the ideologically convinced follower, the ideal sub-
ject of totalitarian rule is someone who has lost the ability to distinguish between truth 
and falsehood. Since all politics is reduced to a spectacle, this notion of truth and 
falsehood can easily be reduced to two contesting spectacles vying for dominance. 
Here the demand for social justice and racial equality is a spectacle to be counter-
poising the demand for law and order. Similarly the narrative of environmental degra-
dation, which is causing suffering in communities across the world is also dismissed 
as another spectacle, which is then confronted with the spectacle of a communist plot 
to dismantle capitalism in the United States. These spectacles aren’t geographically 
or temporally restricted and find multiple manifestations in multiple conditions. The 
disinfotainment machine continues to manufacture these binaries, with politics and 
political struggle being replaced by competing spectacles. 

Engels (1845c), as we previously saw, outlines the conditions in which the social 
murder of the working class takes place. In modern digital society, the politics of dis-
posability creates new conditions of social murder. Henry A. Giroux (2010) refers to 
this as zombie politics where increasingly neoliberal policies results in the disposses-
sion of millions of people, and are then categorised as human waste. David Harvey 
(2005) identifies this process of cutting down of public welfare measures while in-
creasing the deregulation of private industry as accumulation by dispossession. This 
creates an increasing section of the population who are perennially exposed to the 
vagaries of the political economy, whom Guy Standing (2011) identifies as the pre-
cariat. Social murder in the twenty-first century takes a spectacular form, enacted on 
the screens of our smartphones and televisions, amplified by newsroom debates. 
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The walking hyper-dead even oppose providing the extension of unemployment 
benefits to millions of Americans who are out of work, food, and hope. They 
spectacularize hatred and trade in lies and misinformation. They make populist 
appeals to the people while legitimating the power of the rich. They appeal to 
common sense as a way of devaluing a culture of questioning and critical ex-
change. Unrelenting in their role as archetypes of the hyper-dead, they are mis-
anthropes trading in fear, hatred, and hyper-nationalism (Giroux 2011, 3). 

 
In pitching human society against itself, neoliberal society no longer feels the need to 
justify its violence. Karen Laurie (2002) rightly identifies that the role of the news an-
chor has increasingly started to resemble that of a game show host, rather than a 
voice of reason. While the disinfotainment industry falsifies, spectacularises, and mis-
represents information, the task of the anchor-host is to present both fact and fiction 
as equally valid. In this topsy-turvy world, the demand for free healthcare is the same 
as forcing doctors and nurses to work against their will. The demand for lowering of 
the cost of education and cancellation of burdensome education loans are the same 
as theft from those who have managed to pay off their loans. The demand for a living 
wage is a communist plot to destroy the economy. The demand for greater police 
accountability is encouragement to crime. Exposing war-crimes committed by Ameri-
can forces in Iraq or exposing the widespread surveillance of citizens is treason. The 
deaths caused by the lack of healthcare, police brutality, hate-crimes or imperialist 
wars can definitely be defined as social murders as Engels had defined the term. 

Stuart Hall (1979) explores the contradictions that lead to the destruction of social 
democracy and allows for the emergence of authoritarian populism, leading to a new 
neoliberal consensus. A somewhat similar process has followed the 2007-2008 glob-
al financial crisis allowing for the emergence of a radical right focused on an anti-
immigration and white nationalist rhetoric, which rejected international cosmopolitan-
ism and the social security measures that supposedly draw the underserving immi-
grants to the developed economies in the West (Mirrlees 2019). Hall (1979, 14) 
points out that the general trends do not warrant overlooking the specific historical 
circumstances. We have seen earlier, certain studies have sought to critique the idea 
of the filter bubble (Haim, Graefe and Brosius 2018). However, the filter bubble exists 
not simply as a general phenomenon, but as a historical one in a neoliberal-
spectaclist society, where even exposure to opposing views can serve the purpose of 
further polarisation (Bail et al. 2018). The de-contextualisation of the politics behind 
the spectacle serves the purpose of polarisation rather than providing a holistic con-
text to contradictions (Lyford and Payne 2005). Since, as Debord (1992, 1) points 
out, the spectacle is “a social relation between people that is mediated by images”, it 
can be inferred that the role played by social media, presenting de-contextualised 
images from around the world, can only further increase fragmented views of reality. 
Here social media doesn’t simply play the role of an amplifier of existing contradic-
tions, but is rather an integral element of our contemporary neoliberal society. Social 
networking sites, in the process of prioritising their advertisement-based revenue 
models, ensure that recommender systems lead to filter bubbles, where fact diverges 
from its context and becomes a spectacle. This leads to an increase of human vul-
nerability to authoritarian populist manipulations, which we see happening at present. 
The process of de-contextualisation is in fact a powerful force that can delegitimise 
any narrative. Poverty without the context of the insidious but perpetual violence that 
gives rise to and maintains it, is simply laziness on the part of the poor to work their 
way out of poverty. Subsidised healthcare, food, education or other necessities can 
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be constructed as free hand-outs, once we de-contextualise the very crucial task of 
social stability that they provide. Protests against police brutality, as we have seen 
recently, can be easily equated with savagery and looting, when taken out of the con-
text of the centuries of violence against racial minorities. Slogans directed against 
America will seem a real threat unless seen from the perspective of decades of US 
involvement in imperialist wars around the world. 

The alienation of the prosumer class is thus both manifested and manufactured 
through the spectacle. The disinfotainment industry, in its creation of multiple com-
peting spectacles, essentially projects truth as a marketable commodity, to be malle-
able to the demands of the market. The blurring of the boundary between truth and 
falsehood creates the ideal conditions for totalitarian rule as Hannah Arendt points 
out. The de-contextualisation of facts lies at the root of the spectacle that mediates 
social relations through images. Under such conditions, violence is normalised and 
justified as necessary against illusory threats that are conjured by the spectacle. The 
grassroots mobilisation towards a totalitarian agenda enforced by violence against 
the most vulnerable communities mimics fascism adequately enough to be catego-
rised into the same broad category. This social murder committed under the condi-
tions of digital capitalism, through a withdrawal of necessary social security and in-
creasingly violent instruments of legal coercion, is a crucial instrument in the arsenal 
of neoliberal capitalism in order to ensure the continued obedience on the part of the 
working class. 

5. Conclusion 

Our enquiries into the role played by digital labour in the process of IML, have 
demonstrated the process of alienation of digital labour. Machine learning algorithms 
represent dead labour, which can only sustain and reproduce itself by the living la-
bour provided in the form of digital labour. The alienation of digital labour in the con-
ditions of contemporary neoliberal capitalism leads to the creation of filter bubbles 
that correspond to the alienation of the worker (whom we have identified in our con-
text as the prosumer) from their species being. The alienation from the species being 
is also manifested through the spectacle when the dominant mode of production 
completely subjugates society at large. Recommender systems have played a crucial 
role in the subjugation of social media to financialisation, which has been the key to 
the creation of filter bubbles. Finally we have discussed the growth of fascism as a 
product of the spectacle in society and on social media, which we have identified as 
social murder under the conditions of digital capitalism.  

Engels’s identification of social murder as an instrument of violence employed in 
the control of the working class becomes increasingly relevant. The most common 
form of social murder remains the active denial of necessities for existence like 
healthcare, protection against environmental calamities or degradation of health 
through pollutants, as even Engels had noted. This violence however is accompanied 
by physical and social violence. 

In this country, social war is under full headway, every one stands for himself, 
and fights for himself against all comers, and whether or not he shall injure all 
the others who are his declared foes, depends upon a cynical calculation as to 
what is most advantageous for himself. It no longer occurs to anyone to come 
to a peaceful understanding with his fellow-man; all differences are settled by 
threats, violence, or in a law-court. In short, everyone sees in his neighbour an 
enemy to be got out of the way, or, at best, a tool to be used for his own ad-
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vantage. And this war grows from year to year, as the criminal tables show, 
more violent, passionate, irreconcilable” (Engels 1845c, 427). 

The conditions of social murder thus include both “passive” and “active” violence 
against the most vulnerable sections of the society, and forms the bedrock of fascist 
violence. While Engels had anticipated that this antagonism would result in the con-
frontation between the Bourgeois and Proletariat, the reality of “Bonapartism” contra-
dicted his own estimation. 
 While we should however avoid a simplistic equivalence between Bonapartism, as 
Engels described it, and our contemporary fascist movements, Bonapartism has 
been identified by a number of commentators as a proto-fascist movementsand was 
used by the Comintern as a prototype to model its analysis of fascism upon. Engels 
analysed the conditions of Bonapartism in the following manner: 

Bonapartism is the necessary form of state in a country where the working 
class, at a high level of its development in the towns but numerically inferior to 
the small peasants in rural areas, has been defeated in a great revolutionary 
struggle by the capitalist class, the petty bourgeoisie and the army (Engels 
1865, 72). 

Neoliberal capitalism played a major role in the defeat of the working class in our 
times. We have also recognised the intimate role of neoliberalism in developing digi-
tal capitalism and the subsequent use of the spectacle to dominate and control the 
workers. Engels attributes the rise of Bonapartism to a similar need for dominance 
and control over the working class. A clear and remarkable similarity emerges be-
tween the objectives and the tasks of Bonapartism and the spectaclist variety of fas-
cism that emerges under conditions of digital capitalism. This spectaclist fascism pro-
longs the “social war of all against all” (Engels 1845b, 248) and continues with its his-
toric task of perpetuating capitalist exploitation by disrupting the possibility of any ex-
tended working class solidarity, and intensifying the conditions that make social mur-
der possible in a neoliberal society. Our analysis of digital labour has demonstrated 
that appropriation of prosumer labour plays a crucial role in this process. 

Plainly stated, the digital labour performed by prosumers is converted into the 
spectaclist form of fascism and made into an instrument to control their social being. 
The fascist form both creates the condition of social murder and social violence 
through coercive apparatus of the state, ensuring the passive acceptance of the 
dominant mode of production and its legitimising ideology on the part of the working 
classes. This places us firmly within a Marxist terrain of analysis of digital labour, and 
demonstrates that digital labour is a distinct form of labour that can be recognised 
within a Marxist framework.  
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